

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

Fees

					Hours
12/23/2015	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Complaint and Motion for Partial Summary Disposition	2.80
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - correspondence emails to/from Carol Eberhardt re: Plaintiff's Complaint, Motion for Summary Disposition and service of Complaint	0.30
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence email from Tom Weed re: assignment, answer to complaint	0.10
01/04/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Scheduling Order re: Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Disposition	0.20
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) = telephone discussion with Dianne Winn re: response to FOIA	0.10
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Notice of Hearing on Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Disposition 03/09/16	0.10
	PTO	L210	A104	Review/analyze Complaint and response to FOIA in preparation of Answer	2.60
01/05/2016	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence email to Dianne Winn re: assignment, answer to complaint	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Plaintiff's Complaint	0.20
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Notice of Appearance of James E. Tamm	0.10
01/06/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: civil case	0.20
01/12/2016	PTO	L210	A103	Draft/revise Answer and Affirmative Defenses	2.80
01/13/2016	PTO	L240	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with Sheryl at Judge Anderson re: issue with filing of Answer to Complaint	0.10

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29054

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

					Hours
	PTO	L240	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence sent to clients re: Plaintiff's partial Motion for Summary Disposition; Brief Scheduling Order; hearing date	0.20
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Plaintiff's Complaint, answer to Complaint, Motion for Summary Disposition	0.30
01/28/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: possible resolution	0.10
02/01/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Nick Tsalis re: removal, motion to dismiss	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Motion for Summary Disposition, proposed settlement	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Brian Wassom re: proposal for order admitting liability and payment of fees	0.20
02/10/2016	PTO	L240	A103	Draft/revise response to Plaintiff's motion for partial summary disposition.	2.90
02/11/2016	PTO	L240	A102	Research regarding cases cited by Plaintiff in motion for partial summary disposition	1.60
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails from/to Richard Bisio re: stipulation to dismiss affirmative defenses 2-5	0.20
	JET	L240	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Motion for Summary Disposition on Defendant's Affirmative Defenses	1.50
02/12/2016	PTO	L240	A103	Draft/revise/prepare and file exhibits to response to motion for summary disposition	1.20
	PTO	L240	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with Judge's court re: question re: okay to mail Response to Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Disposition	0.10
	PTO	L240	A108	Communicate (other external) - correspondence sent to Judge Anderson re: Response to Plaintiff's Motion for Partial Summary Disposition	0.10
02/16/2016	PTO	L240	A104	Review/analyze Order Cancelling Oral Argument and Transfer of File for failing to have assigned to judge in Richard Bisio case	0.20
	PTO	L240	A104	Review/analyze Scheduling Order	0.30
	PTO	L190	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence sent to clients re: Scheduling Order	0.30
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Notice of adjournment of Pretrial to 10/17/16	0.10
02/17/2016	PTO	L190	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence sent	

Why were these lawyers discussing settlement without involving the city council, since only the city council is authorized to settle a lawsuit?

Statement No: 29054

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

				Hours		
			to clients re: Response to Motion for Partial Summary Disposition; Second Motion for Summary Disposition; Order Cancelling Oral Argument, Transfer of File for failing to have assigned to judge in Richard Bisio case	0.40		
03/10/2016	PTO	L110	A104 Review/analyze Order for entry of Consent Judgment	0.20		
03/30/2016	JET	L110	A104 Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Motion to approve transfer of case	0.50		
03/31/2016	JET	L110	A104 Review/analyze - Scheduling Order re: Plaintiff's Motion for Summary Disposition	0.20		
	JET	L110	A104 Review/analyze - Order reassigning case to Judge Leo Bowman	0.10		
				<u>20.90</u>	<u>4,380.00</u>	
				For Current Services Rendered		

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
James E. Tamm	7.90	\$250.00	\$1,975.00
Paul T. O'Neill	13.00	185.00	2,405.00

Expenses

01/05/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Notice of Appearance.	5.15
01/08/2016	L110	E101	Copying 2 pages.	0.40
01/12/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 34 pages.	6.80
01/12/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendant's Answer to Complaint, Affirmative Defenses, Jury Demand and POS.	92.70
01/14/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Answer to Complaint, Affirmative Defenses, Jury Demand and Proof of Service.	92.70
01/18/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 18 pages.	3.60
02/12/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendant's Response Brief to MSD.	5.15
02/12/2016	L110	E108	Postage	2.52
02/12/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	71.07
02/22/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 244 pages.	48.80
03/21/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 60 pages.	12.00
				<u>340.89</u>
				Total Expenses

Bisio/Susan vs.
 City of Village of Clarkston
 Our File: 100.3903

Fees

					Hours
04/01/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Order reassigning case to Judge Bowman	0.10
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Order granting Plaintiff's Motion to transfer case from Judge Anderson to Judge Bowman	0.20
04/05/2016	RVS	L110	A104	Review/analyze: review of court docket for status of case and Plaintiff's motions for summary disposition.	0.20
04/11/2016	DRD	L110	A104	Review/analyze file materials, Plaintiff's Complaint, responsive pleadings, Orders.	1.00
	DRD	L110	A104	Review/analyze Plaintiff's Motion for Summary Disposition on Defendant's Affirmative Defenses	0.50
	DRD	L240	A102	Research for Motion for Summary Disposition Response	1.00
04/12/2016	DRD	L240	A102	Research for Motion for Summary Disposition Response (continued)	0.50
	DRD	L240	A103	Draft/revise Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Motion for Summary Disposition on Defendant's Affirmative Defenses	4.00
04/13/2016	DRD	L240	A103	Draft/revise Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's MSD on Defendant's Affirmative Defenses (continued)	6.00
04/18/2016	DRD	L190	A104	Review/analyze research in preparation of Litigation Plan	1.00
04/19/2016	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Revisions to Response to Plaintiff's Motion to Strike Affirmative Defenses	0.80
	DRD	L240	A103	Draft/revise Response to Motion for Summary	

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29318

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

				Disposition	Hours
05/03/2016	JET	L110	A101	Plan and prepare for oral argument on Motions for Summary Disposition - review of case law cited by Plaintiff, cases cited in our brief, preparation of outline for oral argument	2.00
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with court re: oral argument on Plaintiff's and Defendant's Motions for Summary Disposition	4.50
05/04/2016	PTO	L110	A103	Draft/revise Litigation Analysis report	0.20
	JET	L110	A109	Appear for/attend - Cross Motions for Summary Disposition	2.80
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: results of hearing, plan of action	3.30
05/06/2016	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Plaintiff's discovery requests	0.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's First Request for Production of Documents	0.30
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's First Interrogatories to Defendant	0.30
05/10/2016	JET	L210	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Motion in Limine to exclude Evidence of Sanctions Motion and Order	0.50
	JET	L210	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Motion in Limine to exclude Evidence of Plaintiff's Motive for Requesting Records under the FOIA and the intended use of the records	0.50
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: exhibits to Request for Admissions	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence to Richard Bisio re: Follow-up of conversation on 5/18 re: subpoena to Joe Luginski, discovery extension, stipulation to facts, cross motions for summary disposition	0.40
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's First Request for Admissions and Second Interrogatories to Defendants	1.50
05/11/2016	PTO	L330	A108	Communicate (other external) phone conference with R. Bisio regarding deposition requests	0.20
05/12/2016	PTO	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) email correspondence to T. Ryan re: FOIA response	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence from Richard Bisio re: deposition notice of City witnesses, appearance without	

Why was the city attorney consulted about a "plan of action" rather than the city council?

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29318

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
				subpoena	0.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Notice of Deposition of Tom Ryan, Carol Eberhardt, Joe Luginski, Michael Sabol and Alfred Avery	0.20
05/13/2016	PTO	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) email correspondence to R. Bisio regarding subpoenas	0.40
05/16/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Motion to Extend Discovery	0.30
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Motion to Reinstate Case	0.30
05/18/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Opinion and Order on Motions for Summary Disposition	1.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Deposition notice of City representatives, discovery requests (multiple calls)	0.60
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - Telephone discussion with Joe Luginski re: Deposition notice	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Telephone discussion with Richard Bisio re: Court's ruling, discovery requests, status	0.50
	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise exhibit and witness list.	0.50
	PTO	L310	A104	Review/analyze all responses to FOIA from T. Ryan	1.70
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Plaintiff's Request to Admit and Interrogatories, notice of deposition of City representatives, Plaintiff's Motion in Limine re: Susan Bisio's motive in FOIA request, sanctions imposed by court	0.40
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - correspondence email from Carol Eberhardt re: meeting	0.10
05/19/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: service of subpoenas	0.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Proposed stipulation of facts from Richard Bisio	0.80
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: proposed stipulated of facts	0.10
05/20/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Amended Order regarding May 4, 2016 Opinion and Order	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Answers to Requests for Admissions served by Plaintiff, deposition subpoenas	0.20

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29318

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Counter Stipulated Facts	1.50
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Tom Ryan re: proposed stipulated facts	0.10
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Exhibit List	0.30
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Witness List	0.30
05/23/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Clarkston City Charter provisions re: City attorney - in preparation of Counter Stipulated Facts	1.40
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Correspondence withheld by Attorney Ryan in response to FOIA request	2.00
	PTO	L440	A103	Draft/revise jury instructions	2.70
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Defendant's Stipulation of Facts	1.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Fourth Interrogatories to Defendant	0.10
05/24/2016	PTO	L110	A102	Research re: agency relationship of city attorney and city	0.70
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Plaintiff's appeal, Motion for Stay	0.20
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Additional revisions to Stipulated Facts	0.30
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Request for Admissions and Interrogatories to Plaintiff	2.40
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: Motion to Reinstate, extend discovery, adjournment of motions in limine	0.20
05/25/2016	JET	L110	A109	Appear for/attend - Plaintiff's Motion to Reinstate Case, extend deadlines in Scheduling Order	2.10
	PTO	L110	A104	Review/analyze appellate docket sheet to determine deadlines	0.80
	PTO	L110	A104	Review/analyze motion for expedited consideration	0.40
	PTO	L110	A104	Review/analyze application for leave to appeal	2.10
	PTO	L110	A103	Draft/revise motion for stay of proceedings in circuit court	2.30
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Additional revisions to Request for Admissions to Plaintiff	0.50
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's revisions to Defendant's redlined 5/24/16 Stipulated Facts	0.80
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: revisions to stipulated facts, postponement of depositions	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: deposition dates, extension of responding to discovery requests, Plaintiff's application and	

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29318

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
				motion for immediate reconsideration, motion for stay of proceedings	0.30
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence from Richard Bisio re: revisions to stipulated facts	0.10
05/26/2016	PTO	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) telephone discussion with commissioner regarding response time for motion for expedited consideration	0.30
	PTO	L110	A103	Draft/revise response to motion for expedited consideration	3.90
	PTO	L110	A102	Research regarding whether city attorney is agent of city for purposes of FOIA	2.30
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Outcome of hearing on Plaintiff's Motion to reopen case and extending Scheduling Order dates, new dates for discovery	0.40
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Re-Notice of Hearing on Motion in Limine to Exclude Evidence of Sanctions, Records under FOIA	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: producing witnesses without subpoena, stipulated facts, extension of response to Plaintiff's discovery requests	0.20
05/27/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Response opposing Defendant's Motion for Stay of Proceedings	0.90
05/31/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: proposed revisions to stipulated facts	0.20
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Plaintiff's response to Motion for Stay	0.30
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Tom Ryan re: Plaintiff's revisions to Stipulated Facts	0.10
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Order Extending Dates	0.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Notice of Adjournment of Trial/Trial Notice 1-5-17	0.10
06/01/2016	PTO	L310	A102	Research regarding frank communications exception	2.90
	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise - Begin preparation of answers to first request for admissions and second interrogatories.	0.30
	PTO	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Telephone call to Plaintiff's attorney re: Requests for Admissions and Interrogatories.	0.10
06/02/2016	PTO	L310	A106	Communicate (with client) telephone discussion with T. Ryan's office regarding FOIA documents	0.20

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29318

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
	PTO	L310	A106	Communicate (with client) preparation of e-mail correspondence to T. Ryan's office regarding withheld documents	0.30
	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise - response to first requests for admission	1.80
	PTO	L310	A102	Research regarding case law on FOIA exclusions	2.10
	PTO	L310	A102	Research regarding federal FOIA cases	2.70
	PTO	L510	A102	Research regarding application for leave to appeal	2.30
06/03/2016	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise - continued response to first request for admissions	3.10
06/06/2016	PTO	L430	A103	Draft/revise response to motion in limine regarding motive for FOIA	2.30
	PTO	L430	A103	Draft/revise - Response to motion in limine regarding sanctions order	2.80
	PTO	L310	A108	Communicate (other external) telephone discussion with T. Ryan regarding responses to request for admissions	0.40
	PTO	L310	A104	Review/analyze and preparation of revisions to responses to request for admissions per T. Ryan	2.20
06/07/2016	PTO	L510	A102	Research regarding FOIA definition of public records	1.70
	PTO	L510	A102	Research regarding FOIA definition of public body	1.40
	PTO	L510	A103	Draft/revise and preparation of response to application for leave to appeal - introduction and outline	4.40
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Motion hearing, proposed stipulated facts	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Telephone discussion with Richard Bisio re: proposed stipulated facts, Motion for Stay, request to adjourn Motions in Limine	0.20
	JET	L110	A102	Research - cases cited by Plaintiff - <i>Rataj v Romulus</i> ; <i>Taylor v Lansing Board of Power and Lights</i> in prep of motion hearing	2.80
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Return of Service of Joseph Luginski, Tom Ryan, Alfred Avery, Carol Eberhardt re: notice of deposition	0.20
06/08/2016	JMO	L520	A104	Review/analyze: review Defendant's answer to Plaintiff's Application for Leave to Appeal.	0.40
	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise and prepare responses to second requests for admission	2.20
	PTO	L110	A102	Research regarding cases cited by Plaintiff on FOIA	2.70
	PTO	L510	A103	Draft/revise and continued preparation of answer to application for leave to appeal - section on exceptions to disclosure	3.90

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29318

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

				Hours
	JET	L110	A109 Appear for/attend - Plaintiff's Motion in Limine to prevent reference to sanctions and Motion in Limine to prevent proof of motive, and Defendant's Motion for Stay of Proceedings	3.40
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) - Telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: results of motion hearing	0.20
	JET	L110	A106 Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Hearing outcome on Motion for Stay and Motions in Limine	0.40
	JET	L110	A104 Review/analyze - Order denying Defendant's Motion for Stay of Proceedings	0.20
	JET	L110	A104 Review/analyze - Order denying Plaintiff's Motion in Limine to exclude evidence of Plaintiff's Motion requesting records under FOIA	0.20
06/09/2016	JET	L110	A104 Review/analyze - Court's Scheduling Order (7 pages)	0.50
	PTO	L510	A103 Draft/revise - Answer to application for leave to appeal - section on FOIA request and procedural history	3.70
	PTO	L510	A103 Draft/revise - continued preparation of answer to application for leave to appeal - section on public records	5.20
	PMI	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) to Richard Bisio re: Second Request for Admissions.	0.10
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) - Telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: withheld documents, stipulated facts	0.20
06/10/2016	JMO	L520	A104 Review/analyze: receipt and review of Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Application for Leave to Appeal.	1.80
	JMO	L520	A105 Communicate (in firm): discussion with Paul T. O'Neill re Response Brief.	0.20
	PTO	L510	A104 Review/analyze and finalize answer to application for leave to appeal	4.60
	PTO	L510	A103 Draft/revise - prepare exhibits to answer to application for leave to appeal	1.10
	JET	L110	A104 Review/analyze - Appeal Brief and preparation of revisions	1.50
06/13/2016	JET	L110	A104 Review/analyze - Order denying Plaintiff's Motion in Limine to exclude evidence of sanctions	0.20
	JET	L110	A108 Communicate (other external) - correspondence email to Carol Eberhardt re: meetings with City representatives re: depositions	0.10
06/15/2016	PTO	L110	A104 Review/analyze documents from T. Ryan regarding records withheld from FOIA request	1.70

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29318

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

					Hours
06/21/2016	JET	L110	A102	Research re: FOIA, public body definition, case law in preparation of Litigation Plan	2.50
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - additions/revisions to Litigation Plan	2.40
06/22/2016	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Litigation Plan - continued prep	1.20
	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise responses to interrogatories	2.50
06/23/2016	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise - continued preparation of answers to interrogatories; preparation of e-correspondence to T. Ryan regarding draft answers.	2.10
06/27/2016	PTO	L210	A104	Review/analyze - Receipt and review Memo of Correction of Payment and Proof of Service.	0.10
	PTO	L310	A106	Communicate (with client) telephone discussion with T. Ryan regarding edits to draft response to interrogatories	0.40
06/30/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: status, Plaintiff's reply brief	0.20
	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise draft response to interrogatories based on T. Ryan comments	0.80
	PTO	L310	A106	Communicate (with client) correspondence email to T. Ryan regarding revised draft of interrogatory response	0.20
For Current Services Rendered					153.90
					31,988.00

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
James E. Tamm	51.70	\$250.00	\$12,925.00
Julie McCann O'Connor	2.40	250.00	600.00
Paul T. O'Neill	83.50	185.00	15,447.50
Richard V. Stokan, Jr.	0.20	185.00	37.00
Paul M. Indyk	0.10	185.00	18.50
David R. Drwencke	16.00	185.00	2,960.00

Expenses

04/12/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	16.52
04/19/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 34 pages.	6.80
04/20/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendants' Response to Plaintiff's MSD.	5.15
04/20/2016	L110	E107	Delivery services/messengers - Birmingham Delivery - N/A - Inv. 6806 - court filing at Oakland County	59.00
04/21/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 106 pages.	21.20
05/03/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 69 pages.	13.80
05/03/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	10.06
05/04/2016	L110	E109	Local travel - 17 miles Bloomfield Hills to Pontiac, MI and return	8.50
05/06/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 2 pages.	0.20

Statement No: 29318

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

05/12/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	14.37
05/17/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 100 pages.	20.00
05/18/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 16 pages.	3.20
05/19/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 4 pages.	0.80
05/20/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendant's Witness List	5.15
05/20/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendant's Exhibit List.	5.15
05/20/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 26 pages.	5.20
05/24/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 53 pages.	10.60
05/24/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	14.37
05/25/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Motion for Stay	25.75
05/25/2016	L110	E109	Local travel - 17 miles Bloomfield Hills, MI to Allen Park, MI and return	8.50
05/26/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 178 pages.	35.60
05/26/2016	L110	E108	Postage	6.45
05/27/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 4 pages.	0.80
05/27/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendants' First Request for Admissions	5.15
05/27/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - ReNotice of Hearing Motion for Stay.	5.15
06/01/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 76 pages.	15.20
06/06/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 99 pages.	19.80
06/06/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Response to Motion in Limine re: FOIA	5.15
06/06/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Response to Motion in Limine - exclude evidence re: sanctions	5.15
06/07/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Response to Requests for Admissions.	5.15
06/08/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 178 pages.	35.60
06/08/2016	L110	E109	Local travel - 17 miles Bloomfield Hills, MI to Pontiac, MI and return	8.50
06/10/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 87 pages.	17.40
			Total Expenses	419.42

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

Fees

					Hours
07/01/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence from Richard Bisio re: deficiencies in City's Answers to Interrogatories, responses to 1st and 4th interrogatories to City (4 pages)	0.50
	PTO	L510	A104	Review/analyze Reply Brief on Appeal	0.90
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Response to Defendant's First Request for Admissions (20 pages)	1.80
07/07/2016	PTO	L510	A108	Communicate (other external) teleconference with Court of Appeals commissioner regarding issuance of order	0.30
07/08/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Notice of Case Evaluation on 9/14/16	0.10
07/11/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails from/to Richard Bisio re: motion to remove case from case evaluation, adjournment of trial	0.20
07/12/2016	PTO	L510	A106	Communicate (with client) re: Court of Appeals Order.	0.10
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Motion to remove case from Case Evaluation docket	0.60
07/13/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to/from Richard Bisio re: concurrence in motion to remove case from case evaluation docket	0.10
07/14/2016	PTO	L310	A104	Review/analyze proposed stipulations of fact	1.10

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
07/15/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails from/to Richard Bisio re: depositions of City representatives	0.30
	JET	L210	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Third Requests for Admissions and Fifth Interrogatories to Defendant	0.30
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: deposition of Susan Bisio	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: his 6/29/16 letter	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: obtaining dates for City witnesses, request for deposition of Susan Bisio	0.10
07/18/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: deposition dates of City witnesses	0.20
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence email to client re: Plaintiff's request for depositions of Avery, Eberhardt, Ryan, Saboi and Luginski	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails to/from Tom Ryan re: request for deposition, availability	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Answers to Interrogatories and discovery requests	0.20
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with Carol Eberhardt re: deposition/meeting	0.20
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone call to Al Avery re: deposition request	0.20
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Revised Stipulated Facts	0.90
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: deposition of Susan Bisio	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails to/from Richard Bisio re: depositions of City representatives, anticipated length of depositions	0.30
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: depositions of Ryan, Eberhardt, Avery	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: depositions of Ryan, Eberhardt, Avery	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to/from Tom Ryan re: deposition availability	0.20

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

				Hours	
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence email to Eberhardt, Avery, Ryan, Luginski and Sabol re: Plaintiff's request for deposition, meeting/deposition availability	0.30
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - correspondence email from Joe Luginski re: deposition availability	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: deposition of Susan Bisio	0.10
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - correspondence email from Mike Sabol re: deposition	0.10
07/19/2016	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - correspondence email from Mike Sabol re: availability for deposition	0.10
07/20/2016	PTO	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) email to C. Eberhardt regarding executing interrogatory responses	0.10
	JET	L110	A109	Appear for/attend - Defendant's Motion to remove case from case evaluation docket	1.50
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with Carol Eberhardt re: Plaintiff's deposition request	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Richard Bisio re: deposition schedule	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: depositions of City representatives	0.20
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with Mike Sabol re: deposition request, meeting to discuss testimony	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: depositions of Eberhardt, Avery, dates for depositions	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: coordinating dates for depositions to avoid conflicts	0.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's first re-notice of depositions of City representatives	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio (8:19 p.m.) re: offering of deposition dates, notice of depositions	0.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Motion for Discovery Sanctions and other appropriate relief for Defendant's to respond to discovery requests	1.80
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio (1:38	

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
				p.m.) re: follow-up on morning discussion re: Plaintiff's re-notice of depositions of City witnesses, specific dates for depositions	0.20
JET	L110	A107		Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio (5:07 p.m.) re: Plaintiff's re-notice of depositions of City witnesses, specific dates for depositions	0.20
JET	L110	A107		Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio (8:19 p.m.) re: Response to specific dates for depositions	0.20
07/21/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Order removing case from case evaluation docket	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Richard Bisio re: depositions, Motion to Compel Discovery	0.20
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with Carol Eberhardt re: signed discovery	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: discovery, deposition	0.20
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with Al Avery re: deposition and meeting	0.10
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with Joe Luginski re: deposition and meeting	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: arbitrary deposition notice, scheduling depositions, dates for depositions of Luginski, Eberhardt, Avery, Ryan, Sabol	0.30
	PTO	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - Telephone call from client re: signing of defendant's response to discovery requests.	0.10
	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise Defendant's response to Plaintiff's First Request for Production of Documents - begin.	0.30
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: hearing on Motion to remove case from case evaluation docket, Plaintiff's Motion to Compel Discovery, depositions of City representatives	0.40
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - telephone discussion with Joe Luginski re: deposition availability	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio (11:45 a.m.) re: Plaintiff's arbitrary deposition notice, response to availability for deposition	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) -	

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

				Hours
			correspondence email from Richard Bisio (12:48 p.m.) re: Plaintiff's arbitrary deposition notice, coordinating depositions	0.20
07/22/2016	PTO	L310	A103 Draft/revise responses to first interrogatories	1.70
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: deposition of Mike Sabol	0.10
	JET	L110	A104 Review/analyze - Plaintiff's second re-notice of depositions of City representatives	0.10
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: availability of City representatives, deposition schedule, not waiving objections or right to file motion to preclude depositions	0.30
	JET	L110	A108 Communicate (other external) - correspondence emails to/from Joe Luginski re: deposition notice, meeting to discuss deposition	0.30
	JET	L110	A108 Communicate (other external) - correspondence emails to/from Carol Eberhardt re: signed Answers to Interrogatories	0.10
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other external) - correspondence emails to/from Richard Bisio re: deposition of Susan Bisio	0.20
	RVS	L250	A104 Review/analyze: review of file in preparation of response to motion for sanctions for failure to comply with discovery.	0.50
	RVS	L250	A104 Review/analyze: review of Plaintiff's motion for discovery sanctions.	0.70
	RVS	L250	A103 Draft/revise: preparation of response to Plaintiff's motion for discovery sanctions.	2.60
	RVS	L250	A102 Research re authority cited in Plaintiff's motion for discovery sanctions and court authority to issue discovery sanctions.	0.90
	RVS	L250	A103 Draft/revise: final revisions to response to Plaintiff's motion for discovery sanctions.	1.50
07/25/2016	JET	L110	A108 Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with Mike Sabol re: deposition testimony	0.30
	JET	L110	A109 Appear for/attend - Meeting with Joe Luginski in Clarkston	3.00
	JET	L110	A108 Communicate (other external) -Correspondence email to Mike Sabol re: deposition request	0.10
	JET	L110	A108 Communicate (other external) - Correspondence emails from/to Joe Luginski re: deposition request, meeting	0.20
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) - Correspondence email from/to Richard Bisio re: deposition of Mike Sabol	0.10
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) -	

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
				Correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: City's responses to discovery requests re witnesses and exhibits	0.20
JET	L110	A107		Communicate (other outside counsel) - Correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: City's responses to discovery requests re witnesses and exhibits	0.30
PTO	L110	A103		Draft/revise index of materials withheld from FOIA request	0.70
PTO	L110	A103		Draft/revise responses to request for production of documents	1.50
07/26/2016	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with Carol Eberhardt re: Answers to Plaintiff's third Request for Admissions	0.20
	JET	L110	A109	Appear for/attend - Deposition of Joe Luginski at O'Connor, DeGrazia, Tamm & O'Connor	1.80
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Answers to third Request for Admissions	0.20
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - Correspondence email from Carol Eberhardt re: response to Plaintiff's third request for admissions	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: follow-up of discussion following Joe Luginski's deposition re: amendment to City's answers to City's second request for admissions and third interrogatories, adjournment of Plaintiff's motion to compel	0.30
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: review of City's draft stipulation of facts	0.20
	PTO	L240	A104	Review/analyze file materials for motion hearing re: discovery	0.80
	JET	L110	A109	Appear for/attend - Conference with Attorney Thomas Ryan re: deposition preparation	1.50
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Response to Third Request for Admissions and Fifth Interrogatories	0.50
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Notice of Taking Deposition Duces Tecum of Susan Bisio	0.50
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - correspondence to Carol Eberhardt re: Plaintiff's third request for admissions	0.30
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: Amendment of answers to Plaintiff's second Request for Admissions and third Interrogatories to Defendants, adjournment of Plaintiff's Motion to Compel Discovery	0.30
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) -	

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

					Hours
				correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: Response to email re: amended discovery responses	0.20
07/27/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Correspondence email to Tom Ryan re: Bisio's email re: stipulated facts	0.10
	PTO	L240	A109	Appear for/attend hearing on motion regarding discovery	3.60
	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise - preparation of amended responses to second requests for admissions	1.30
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Richard Bisio re: deposition cancellation of Alfred Avery	0.10
	JET	L110	A109	Appear for/attend - Meeting with Carol Eberhardt, City of Clarkston Manager re: deposition preparation	2.40
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's 6th set of Interrogatories and 4th Request for Production of Documents	0.80
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Answers to Plaintiff's discovery requests	0.30
	JET	L110	A109	Appear for/attend - Deposition of Carol Eberhardt	1.80
	JET	L110	A109	Appear for/attend - Meeting with Al Avery re: deposition preparation	0.80
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence to Tom Ryan re: proposed answers to third set of request for admissions	0.10
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Facebook pages of Richard Bisio (6 pages)	0.50
07/28/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: testimony of Carol Eberhardt, existence of contract for legal services with City/Village of Clarkston	0.20
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone call to Mike Sobol re: cancellation of deposition	0.10
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Order on Plaintiff's Motion for Discovery Sanctions (4 pages)	0.50
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails from/to Richard Bisio re: cancellation of depositions of Al Avery and Mike Sabol	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails from Richard Bisio re: follow-up of discussion during Carol Eberhardt's deposition re: city attorney contract	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails to Richard Bisio re: City attorney contract, response to Plaintiff's first set of	

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

					Hours
				Request for Production of Documents	0.30
07/29/2016	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - correspondence to Carol Eberhardt re: City attorney contract	0.30
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Hearing on Plaintiff's Motion to Compel Discovery, stipulation on record re: Tom Ryan's letters re: City business, depositions of City witnesses, Plaintiff's sixth set of discovery requests, Motion for Protective Order	0.30
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - summary of deposition of Joe Luginski	0.40
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone discussion with Carol Eberhardt re: production of documents, attorney contract	0.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - City of Keego Harbor Contract for Attorney Services	0.10
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - correspondence email to Carol Eberhardt re: City Attorney Contract between Village and Thomas Ryan	0.30
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other external) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: follow-up re: City attorney contract, Eberhardt's deposition testimony	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other external) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: follow-up re: Carol Eberhardt's deposition testimony	0.30
08/01/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Tom Ryan re: meeting to prepare for deposition, review of Eberhardt's deposition transcript	0.10
	JMO	L240	A104	Review/analyze: review of file for preparation of motion for summary disposition; review FOIA statute.	1.50
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: transcript of Eberhardt's deposition	0.20
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - Summary of deposition of Carol Eberhardt	0.60
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: deposition of Carol Eberhardt, production of contract with Tom Ryan, Motion for Protective Order	0.30
08/02/2016	JMO	L240	A104	Review/analyze: review file to assist in preparation of motion for summary disposition (complaint, various FOIA requests and correspondence, Plaintiff's motion for summary disposition (filed contemporaneously with complaint).	1.90
	LBS	L250	A102	Research case law.	1.00
	LBS	L250	A103	Draft/revise - Motion and Brief in Support of Motion	

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

				Hours
			for PRotective Order and changes to Motion.	1.70
JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: deposition testimony	0.20
JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Richard Bisio re: deposition of Tom Ryan	0.20
JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - telephone discussion with Dianne Winn re: Motion for Summary Disposition, status going forward	0.20
JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: deposition of Tom Ryan to August 4	0.10
JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails from/to Richard Bisio re: protective order re: Plaintiff's sixth set of interrogatories and second request to produce	0.30
JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence emails from/to Richard Bisio (additional emails x3) re: City's Motion for Protective Order, deposition of Tom Ryan	0.30
JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Third Re-Notice of Deposition of Tom Ryan	0.10
JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails from/to Richard Bisio (x4) re: Motion for Protective Order	0.50
08/03/2016	JET	L110	A104 Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Response in Opposition to Motion for Protective Order	1.50
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: deposition conflict	0.20
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone call from Tom Ryan re: Eberhardt's deposition transcript	0.10
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails from/to Richard Bisio re: rescheduling deposition of Mr. Ryan	0.20
08/04/2016	JMO	L240	A102 Research - review case law cited in Plaintiff's motion for summary disposition.	2.00
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence emails from/to Tom Ryan re: deposition availability	0.20
	JET	L110	A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) - email to Richard Bisio re: deposition of Tom Ryan	0.10
	JET	L110	A108 Communicate (other external) - email from Sandy Miller re: 6/7/15 FOIA request	0.10
	JET	L110	A108 Communicate (other external) - telephone call to Sandy Miller re: Susan Bisio's 6/7/15 FOIA request	0.20
08/05/2016	JET	L110	A101 Plan and prepare for deposition of Susan Bisio - preparation of outline for cross-examination	2.50

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
08/08/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Fourth Re-Notice of Taking Deposition of Tom Ryan	0.10
	JET	L110	A109	Appear for/attend - Deposition of Susan Bisio in Troy	3.20
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - revisions to proposed Stipulation of Facts	0.50
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Susan Bisio deposition, lack of Village email address, deposition preparation	0.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Documents produced by Plaintiff in response to Susan Bisio's deposition notice	1.40
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - email from Richard Bisio re: revised stipulated facts, objection to paragraphs no. 12 and 13	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - email to Richard Bisio re: review of stipulated facts, inclusion of paragraphs 12 and 13, email exchanges of Tom Ryan	0.30
	JMO	L240	A102	Research: review case law cited in Plaintiff's first Motion for Summary Disposition.	0.90
	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise requests for admissions for proposed stipulations objected to by Bisio	1.20
	PTO	L310	A102	Research prior admissions regarding agency	0.30
	PTO	L310	A104	Review/analyze responses to discovery re: Ryan testimony	1.60
08/09/2016	JET	L110	A101	Plan and prepare for deposition of Tom Ryan	1.00
	JET	L110	A109	Appear for/attend - Deposition of Tom Ryan at O'Connor, DeGrazia, Tamm & O'Connor	2.40
	JMO	L240	A102	Research: review case law cited in Plaintiff's first Motion for Summary Disposition.	1.40
	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - summary of deposition of Susan Bisio	0.90
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: deposition of Susan Bisio, proposed stipulated facts, Plaintiff's objections to stipulated facts	0.30
08/10/2016	PTO	L240	A109	Appear for/attend hearing regarding motion for protective order at Oakland County Circuit Court	3.20
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - Telephone discussion with Dianne Winn re: pretrial date	0.10
08/11/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Order denying Defendant's Motion for Protective Order	0.10
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - correspondence emails from/to Tom Ryan re: FOIA requests	0.10
08/15/2016	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - summary of deposition of Tom Ryan	0.80

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - Correspondence to client re: deposition of Tom Ryan, Motion for Summary Disposition deadline	0.30
08/16/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Plaintiff's refusal to stipulate to facts	0.20
08/17/2016	JMO	L240	A104	Review/analyze: review Plaintiff's and Defendant's Application for Leave to Appeal and Response.	2.30
08/18/2016	JMO	L240	A102	Research: review of case law cited in Plaintiff's Motion for Summary Disposition/Brief.	4.80
	PTO	L310	A103	Draft/revise responses to 6th interrogatories for signature by C. Eberhardt	0.60
	PTO	L310	A106	Communicate (with client) emails to/from C. Eberhardt regarding answers to interrogatories	0.20
08/19/2016	JMO	L240	A102	Research: legal research re "public body" and "public record;" review recent case law.	5.40
	PTO	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - Email to client re: answers to discovery.	0.10
	JET	L250	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Motion for Protective Order prohibiting further inquiry into irrelevant matters and terminating Plaintiff's deposition	1.80
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: close of discovery, Plaintiff's Motion for Protective Order	0.20
08/22/2016	JMO	L240	A104	Review/analyze: review of deposition testimony of Thomas Ryan; review federal cases re FOIA (requirements for disclosure, what factors constitute control); preparation of brief in support of Defendant's Motion for Summary Disposition.	6.40
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: stipulation for protective order	0.20
08/23/2016	PTO	L310	A106	Communicate (with client) - Email to C. Eberhardt re: signing answers to discovery.	0.10
	PTO	L310	A106	Communicate (with client) - Email from C. Eberhardt re: response re: signing answers to discovery.	0.10
	PTO	L310	A106	Communicate (with client) - Telephone call from C. Eberhardt re: question re: correct discovery responses.	0.10
	PTO	L310	A106	Communicate (with client) - Email to C. Eberhardt re: response re: question re: correct discovery responses.	0.10
	PTO	L310	A106	Communicate (with client) - Email from C. Eberhardt re: signed discovery responses.	0.10

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
	JMO	L240	A103	Draft/revise: preparation of brief in support of Defendant's Motion for Summary Disposition.	5.90
08/25/2016	RVS	L250	A104	Review/analyze: review of Plaintiff's motion for protective order and sanctions in prep of response	0.60
	RVS	L250	A104	Review/analyze: review of file re correspondence and deposition transcript of Plaintiff in preparation of response to Plaintiff's motion for protective order and sanctions.	0.70
	RVS	L250	A103	Draft/revise: Initial preparation of response to Plaintiff's motion for protective order and sanctions.	1.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Telephone discussion with Richard Bisio re: request to dismiss, Motion for Protective Order	0.20
	JMO	L240	A103	Draft/revise: preparation of Defendant's Brief in Support of Motion for Summary Disposition.	6.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email to Richard Bisio re: Protective Order	0.30
08/26/2016	RVS	L250	A108	Communicate (other external): telephone call to court clerk re motion response due date.	0.10
	RVS	L250	A103	Draft/revise: continued preparation of response to Plaintiff's motion for protective order and sanctions.	2.60
	RVS	L250	A102	Research re sanctions for frivolous motions for protective orders.	0.90
08/29/2016	RVS	L250	A104	Review/analyze: review of pleadings and correspondence with Plaintiff's counsel re response to Plaintiff's motion for protective order and sanctions.	0.70
	RVS	L250	A102	Research re protective order sanctions and sanctions for conduct during depositions.	0.80
	RVS	L250	A103	Draft/revise: final preparation of response to Plaintiff's motion for protective order and sanctions.	1.40
	JMO	L240	A103	Draft/revise: review and revise Defendant's Brief in Support of Motion for Summary Disposition.	6.30
08/30/2016	JMO	L240	A103	Draft/revise: preparation of motion for summary disposition, continued revision of brief.	6.00
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from Richard Bisio re: City's Response to Motion for Protective Order, dismissing praecipe	0.20
08/31/2016	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Plaintiff's withdrawal of Motion for Protective Order	0.30

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone call to court re: withdrawal of motion for protective order	0.10
09/01/2016	JMO	L240	A104	Review/analyze: review of 2015 Court of Appeals opinion that City Clerk was not "public official" per open meetings act; prepare final edits to motion for summary disposition.	1.50
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Response to Defendant's Second Request for Admissions and Interrogatories	1.50
09/06/2016	JET	L110	A103	Draft/revise - revisions to Motion for Summary Disposition	2.00
09/07/2016	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Plaintiff's Answers to Second Request for Admissions, Motion for Summary Disposition	0.30
09/08/2016	JMO	L240	A108	Communicate (other external): telephone discussions with Court Clerk re motion for summary disposition filing (x2).	0.20
	SAK	L120	A102	Research re: FOIA law.	0.20
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone call to Richard Bisio re: concurrence in Motion for Summary Disposition	0.10
09/09/2016	JMO	L240	A103	Draft/revise: preparation of Re-Notice of Hearing on Motion for Summary Disposition.	0.20
09/12/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Scheduling Order on Defendant's Motion for Summary Disposition	0.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Scheduling Order on Plaintiff's Cross Motion for Summary Disposition	0.20
09/16/2016	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Motion for Summary Disposition Scheduling Order	0.30
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - correspondence email from/to Richard Bisio re: concurrence in Motion for Summary Disposition	0.20
09/20/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Re-Notice of Hearing of Cross Motion for Summary Disposition	0.10
09/21/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Plaintiff's Motion for Order requiring Defendant to justify its claims of exemptions for in-camera inspection of contested records	1.00
09/22/2016	JMO	L240	A104	Review/analyze: receipt and review of Plaintiff's Response to Defendant's Motion for Summary	

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

				Hours		
Disposition and Request for Summary Disposition per MCR 2.116(1)(2); Plaintiff's Cross-Motion for Summary Disposition of Defendant's Affirmative Defenses (begin)				6.80		
09/23/2016	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone call to case evaluation clerk re: notice of late fee (sent in error)	0.10	
09/26/2016	JMO	L240	A104	Review/analyze: review of Plaintiff's Cross-Motion for Summary Disposition and including transcript of T. Ryan Deposition.	3.60	
	JMO	L240	A105	Communicate (in firm): conference with James Tamm re arguments raised by Plaintiff.	0.50	
	JMO	L240	A102	Research: legal research (attorney work product exemption).	3.50	
	JET	L110	A105	Communicate (in firm) - Conference with Julie McCann O'Connor re: response to argument raised in Counter Motion for Summary Disposition	0.50	
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Plaintiff's response to Motion for Summary Disposition, cross Motion for Summary Disposition by Plaintiff	0.30	
09/27/2016	SAK	L520	A102	Research re: FOIA.	0.30	
	JMO	L250	A103	Draft/revise - continued review of case law re work product FOIA exemption; Sec. 243(1)(h); preparation of Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Cross-Motion for Summary Disposition.	7.00	
09/28/2016	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - email to Dianne Winn and Tom Ryan re: Plaintiff's Motion for Summary Judgment and response	0.10	
09/29/2016	JMO	L250	A103	Draft/revise: review case law re waiver of work product privilege, real party in interest (MCR 2.201(B)); continued preparation of response to Plaintiff's cross-motion for summary disposition, review undisclosed material sought by Plaintiff under FOIA.	6.70	
09/30/2016	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - correspondence to client re: Plaintiff's Motion for Order requiring justification of exemptions and in-camera inspection	0.30	
For Current Services Rendered				187.50	44,372.50	

Recapitulation

Timekeeper	Hours	Rate	Total
James E. Tamm	68.10	\$250.00	\$17,025.00
Julie McCann O'Connor	80.90	250.00	20,225.00

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
Lauri B. Stewart	2.70	\$185.00	\$499.50
Paul T. O'Neill	20.20	185.00	3,737.00
Richard V. Stokan, Jr.	15.10	185.00	2,793.50
Stephanie A. Karisny	0.50	185.00	92.50

Expenses

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

08/24/2016	L110	E115	Deposition transcripts - Bienenstock Court Reporting - N/A - Inv. 611479 - deposition of Thomas J. Ryan.	124.36
06/02/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	24.80
06/06/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	5.51
06/07/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	26.18
06/08/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	26.18
06/09/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	5.51
06/10/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	11.02
07/05/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 60 pages.	12.00
07/12/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Motion to remove from case evaluation.	25.75
07/18/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 2 pages.	0.40
07/20/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 51 pages.	10.20
07/21/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 57 pages.	11.40
07/22/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendants Response to Plaintiff's Motion for Discovery Sanctions.	5.15
07/25/2016	L110	E109	Local travel - 48 miles Bloomfield Hills to Clarkston, MI and return	24.00
07/25/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 12 pages.	2.40
07/25/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - POS to Defendants Responses to Discovery.	5.15
07/26/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 13 pages.	2.60
07/27/2016	L110	E109	Local travel - 14 miles to/from OCCC	7.00
07/27/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 51 pages.	10.20
07/27/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendants' Answer to Plaintiffs' 3rd Request for Admissions.	5.15
07/27/2016	L110	E109	Local travel - 48 miles Bloomfield Hills, MI to Clarkston, MI and return	24.00
07/28/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 6 pages.	0.60
07/28/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendants' Amended Response to Second Request for Admissions.	5.15
07/29/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 347 pages.	69.40
07/29/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Deposition Notice of Susan Bisio.	5.15
08/01/2016	L110	E107	Delivery services/messengers - Birmingham Delivery - N/A - Inv. 6865 - Court filing at OCCC - Judge's copy of Response to Motion for Sanctions.	59.00
08/02/2016	L100	E115	Deposition transcripts - Bienenstock Court Reporting - N/A - Inv. 610354 - deposition of Carol Eberhardt.	213.94
08/02/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	8.00
08/03/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendant's Motion for Protective Order.	25.75
08/03/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 437 pages.	87.40

Statement No: 29498

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

08/03/2016	L110	E107	Delivery services/messengers - Birmingham Delivery - N/A - Inv. 6866 - court filing at OCCC - Judge's Copy of response to Judge Bowman.	59.00
08/04/2016	L110	E115	Deposition transcripts - Bienenstock Court Reporting - N/A - Inv. 610542 - deposition of Joseph Luginski	95.76
08/04/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 6 pages.	1.20
08/05/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 93 pages.	18.60
08/08/2016	L110	E109	Local travel - 22 miles Bloomfield Hills, MI to Troy and return	11.00
08/09/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw	30.39
08/15/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 6 pages.	1.20
08/18/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 20 pages.	4.00
08/18/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw	72.14
08/19/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendants' Second Request for Admissions.	5.15
08/19/2016	L110	E115	Deposition transcripts - Bienenstock Court Reporting - N/A - Inv. 611395 - deposition of Susan Bisio.	239.66
08/22/2016	L100	E101	Copying - 65 pages.	13.00
08/22/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw	22.57
08/23/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw	6.40
08/24/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Sixth Interrogatories/Request to Produce.	5.15
08/29/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 170 pages.	34.00
08/29/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	9.60
08/30/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 18 pages.	3.60
09/01/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 90 pages.	18.00
09/06/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 42 pages.	8.40
09/08/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Motion for Summary Disposition	25.75
09/08/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 168 pages.	33.60
09/09/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Re-Notice of Hearing.	5.15
09/12/2016	L110	E107	Delivery services/messengers - Birmingham Delivery - Inv. 6899 - court filing at OCCC - Judge's copy of MSD.	59.00
09/12/2016	L110	E107	Delivery services/messengers - Birmingham Delivery - Inv. 6895 - court filing at OCCC - Judge's copy of Response to Motion for Protective Order.	59.00
09/23/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 39 pages.	7.80
09/30/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 20 pages.	4.00
			Total Expenses	1,696.47

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

Interim Statement

Fees

					Hours
10/04/2016	JMO	L240	A103	Draft/revise: review and revise Defendant's Response to Plaintiff-s Cross-Motion for Summary Disposition; review case law re amendment of pleadings per MCR 2.118(F) to add affirmative defense.	3.90
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: affidavit	0.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Response to Plaintiff's Motion for Summary Disposition and preparation of revisions	1.50
10/06/2016	JMO	L240	A106	Communicate (with client): correspondence to clients re Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Cross-Motion for Summary Disposition.	0.30
	JMO	L250	A104	Review/analyze: review Plaintiff's motion for order to justify exemptions, in camera inspection, etc.	0.50
	JMO	L250	A104	Review/analyze: review relevant case law including <i>Evening News Ass'n</i> (20 pages) for response to Plaintiff's Motion for Exemption, In Camera Inspection, etc.	2.80
10/07/2016	JMO	L250	A103	Draft/revise: preparation of Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Motion for Order to Justify Exemption, etc.	1.50
10/10/2016	JMO	L250	A103	Draft/revise: preparation of Defendant's response to Plaintiff's motion for in camera inspection.	5.50
	JET	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - telephone call to Judge Anderson re: 10/17 Pretrial, transfer of case to Judge Bowman	0.10
10/11/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Minute Man Status Report	0.10
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - email to Robert Magill re: authorizations for University of	

Statement No: 29552

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
	JET	L110	A108	Michigan and Social Security Administration Communicate (other external) - email from/to Minute Man re: authorizations for University of Michigan and Social Security Administration	0.10
	JMO	L250	A108	Communicate (other external): telephone call to Judge's clerk re Judge's copy of Response to Plaintiff's Motion for In Camera Inspection.	0.10
10/18/2016	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - case law cited in Motions for Summary Disposition (City and Plaintiff), Plaintiff's Cross Motion for Summary Disposition and preparation of outline for oral argument	6.50
10/19/2016	MJB	L460	A102	Research re Michigan statutes and case law regarding an award of attorney's fees in an FOIA case.	0.50
	JET	L110	A109	Appear for/attend - Motions for Summary Disposition (Plaintiff and City) and Plaintiff's Cross Motion for Summary Disposition	3.60
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: outcome of ruling on Motions for Summary Disposition	0.20
10/20/2016	MJB	L460	A104	Review/analyze: review of complaint (Susan Bisio v Clarkston), Amended Complaint (Richard Bisio v Clarkston), Defendant's motion for summary disposition for purposes of drafting Defendant's motion for attorney's fees.	2.50
	MJB	L460	A102	Research: legal research re MCL 15.240, MCR 2.114, MCR 2.625, MCL 600.2591 and case law in preparation of drafting Defendant's motion for attorney's fees/costs.	2.00
	MJB	L460	A103	Draft/revise: begin preparation of Defendant's motion for attorney's fees and costs.	1.00
	JET	L110	A106	Communicate (with client) - telephone discussion with Dianne Winn re: motion for costs	0.20
10/21/2016	MJB	L460	A104	Review/analyze: review of complaint (S. Bisio v Clarkston), Amended Complaint (R. Bisio v Clarkston), email chain between Clarkston City Council members, City Council minutes, S. Bisio deposition transcript, S. Bisio FOIA requests and discovery.	3.20
	MJB	L460	A102	Research: legal research re MCL 15.240, MCR 2.114, MCR 2.625, MCL 600.2591 and related case law.	1.50
	MJB	L460	A103	Draft/revise: continued preparation of Defendant's Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	2.20
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Opinion and Order granting City's Motion for Summary Disposition	1.50
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Opinion and Order (to replace	

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29552

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

					Hours
				10-19-16 Order with missing page 8)	0.10
	JET	L110	A104	Review/analyze - Revised Opinion and Order re: Defendant's Motion for Summary Disposition	0.30
	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - email from Richard Bisio re: Plaintiff's appeal of summary disposition order	0.10
10/22/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - discussion with Richard Bisio re: Plaintiff's plan to appeal	0.10
10/24/2016	MJB	L460	A104	Review/analyze: review Court's 19 page order granting Defendant's motion for summary disposition.	0.60
	MJB	L460	A102	Research re MCL 15.240, MCR 2.114, MCR 2.125, MCL 600.2591 and related case in preparation of Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	1.20
	MJB	L460	A103	Draft/revise: continued preparation of Defendant's Motion for Attorney's Fees & Costs.	1.50
10/27/2016	JET	L110	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - telephone discussion with Tom Ryan re: Motion for Costs	0.20
10/31/2016	MJB	L250	A102	Research: legal research (statutory and case law) regarding jurisdiction of circuit court to decide a motion for fees and costs pending an appeal to the Court of Appeals.	1.40
	MJB	L250	A103	Draft/revise: Continued preparation of Defendant's motion for costs and attorney's fees and preparation of exhibits for filing.	1.60
	JMO	L500	A104	Review/analyze: receipt and review of Plaintiff's Docketing Statement.	0.30
	MJB	L250	A103	Draft/revise: preparation of Notice of Hearing on Defendant's Motion for Costs and Attorney's Fees.	0.30
11/01/2016	MJB	L250	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel): email correspondence to Plaintiff's counsel requesting concurrence in Defendant's Motion for Costs and Attorney's Fees.	0.10
11/02/2016	JMO	L500	A104	Review/analyze: receipt and review of case number assignment card from Court of Appeals.	0.10
11/04/2016	MJB	L250	A103	Draft/revise: preparation of Re-Notice of Hearing on Motion for Costs and Attorney's Fees.	0.20
	MJB	L250	A108	Communicate (other external): telephone call to court clerk re overnight delivery of Motion for Costs and Attorney's fees, that court claims it did not receive.	0.10
	MJB	L250	A108	Communicate (other external): correspondence to court enclosing another copy of Motion for Costs	

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06

Statement No: 29552

Bisio/Susan vs.
City of Village of Clarkston
Our File: 100.3903

				Hours		
				0.10		
and Attorney's Fees.						
11/07/2016	MJB	L250	A104	Review/analyze: receipt and review Plaintiff's 20 page Response (with 22 exhibits) to Defendant's motion for costs and attorney's fees, in preparation of Reply.	2.10	
	MJB	L250	A102	Research re MCR 2.119 for motion filing time frame.	0.10	
	MJB	L250	A103	Draft/revise: begin preparation of Reply to Plaintiff's Response to Defendant's Motion for Costs and Attorney's Fees.	3.00	
	MJB	L250	A102	Research: legal research re case law and statutory research in preparation of drafting Reply to Plaintiff's Response to Defendant's motion for costs and attorney's fees.	1.80	
				<u>56.90</u>	<u>12,470.00</u>	
For Current Services Rendered						

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
James E. Tamm	14.90	\$250.00	\$3,725.00
Julie McCann O'Connor	15.00	250.00	3,750.00
Michael J. Bonvolanta	27.00	185.00	4,995.00

Expenses

09/06/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	35.79
09/27/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	13.96
09/27/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	20.76
09/29/2016	L110	E106	Online research - Westlaw.	38.66
10/05/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Response in Opposition to Plaintiff's Cross-Motion for Summary Disposition.	5.15
10/06/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 121 pages.	24.20
10/11/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - OCCC WIZNET - Defendants' Response in Opposition to Plaintiff's Motion.	5.15
10/11/2016	L110	E107	Delivery services/messengers - Birmingham Delivery - N/A - Inv. 6915 - Court filing at Oakland County Circuit Court.	59.00
10/12/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 35 pages.	7.00
10/19/2016	L110	E109	Local travel - 17 miles Bloomfield Hills to Pontiac and return	8.50
10/24/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 38 pages.	7.60
10/31/2016	L110	E112	Court fees - COA WIZNET - Appearance.	5.15
11/01/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 53 pages.	10.60
11/04/2016	L110	E101	Copying - 307 pages.	61.40
Total Expenses				<u>302.92</u>

Received for Filing Oakland County Clerk 2016 NOV 09 PM 03:06